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Description

Introducing our Bolt Fast Charging Stand, the
ultimate solution for keeping your devices
powered up and organised. With its sleek
design and built-in 200mAh battery capacity
for photo taking, this stand ensures you take
great photos and your gadgets stay charged
and within reach at all times. Whether
you&#8217;re at home, in the office, or on the
go, never worry about low battery again.
Experience convenience and reliability with
the Bolt Charging Stand. Note: Please use a
TYPE-C cable and a wall charger to connect
this charging stand, place your phone on the
charging area, your phone will be charged
automatically, the built-in battery will be also
charged at the same time. Disclaimer: The
magnetic ring that comes with the charger, do
not attach that on the stand. The magnetic is
to only be stuck on the back of your phone if
your phone isn&#8217;t mag-safe Product
Dimensions: 120mm H x 79mm (Bottom of
stand) x 60mm (Top of stand) How to Use
Camera Connection: 1. Press and hold the
ON key for 2 seconds, and the blue indicator
flashes. Make sure your mobile Bluetooth is
turned on, search for the new device and
connect; 2. After the connection is successful,
the blue indicator is remains on. At this time,
the mobile phone holder can take photos and
videos. 3. When not in use, press the ON key
for 2 seconds. If the indicator light is off, it
means the power is off. 4. It will automatically
shut down when the battery is low. At this
time, the product needs to be charged. The
red indicator light is always on when charging,
and the light is off when fully charge. The
charging time is about 2.5 hours.

Details

Colours
Black

Decoration Options
Pad Print

Decoration Areas
Pad Print 45mm H x 45mm W

Notes

Details such as measure, weight indications
are approximate figures only. We reserve the
right to change colours, printable areas,
technical details or designs.

Order Process

Why Should You Buy From Us?

Long Trustworthy &
Recognised Member of

APPA
Price Beat Policy for

Same Item
Fast Responsive Team

& Turnaround Time
Best Service, Best

Price & Best Quality

5-Star Google Reviews
& Thousands of Happy

Customers

100% Australian
Company

Big Variety of Goods
from Budget to

Premium

Nationwide Service &
Delivery

Ready to Order?

If you would like to proceed then simply reply to our email and tell us your print requirements and
supply your logos in vector EPS, AI or PDF. We will provide pre-production mock up proof for
approval prior to production if the quote is acceptable and you like to proceed with this order.
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